TABULATION OF BIDS
Opened at 2:00 p.m., C.D.T., Tuesday
August 5, 2014, in Omaha, Nebraska

Anticipated Award Date
September 11, 2014

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 4359

OPPD 345KV MTP-NT & 69KV LINE 58/71
BARE ASCR CONDUCTOR WIRE

Division Manager
Material Management

Compiled by and Certified Correct

$5,600,000.00
Page 1 of 6
BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS
AFL American Furukawa Inc. American Wire Group
BID ITEM 150 Ridgeview Center Dr. 47677 Galleon Dr. 2875 NE 191st Street Suite 305

Duncan, SC 29681

Plymouth, Ml 48170

Miami, FL 33180

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

1. Proposal Price(s)

la. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "ASCR Twisted
Pair Grosbeak™ bare conductor wire (Item
la, Page CD-2)

1b. Freight charge for delivery of the
'ASCR Twisted Pair Grosbeak' bare
conductor wire above F.O.B. Auburn, NE
68305

2a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the ""ASCR Parakeet"
bare conductor wire (Item 2a, Page CD-2)

2b. Freight charge for delivery of the
'ASCR Parakeet' bare conductor wire
above F.O.B. Auburn, NE 68305

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.072/FT

$197,066.67

$0.809/FT

$74,211.33

No Bid

No Bid

$350,146.80

$12,451.85




TABULATION OF BIDS
Opened at 2:00 p.m., C.D.T., Tuesday
August 5, 2014, in Omaha, Nebraska

Anticipated Award Date
September 11, 2014

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 4359

OPPD 345KV MTP-NT & 69KV LINE 58/71
BARE ASCR CONDUCTOR WIRE

Division Manager
Material Management

Compiled by and Certified Correct

$5,600,000.00
Page 2 of 6
BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS
AFL American Furukawa Inc. American Wire Group
BID ITEM 150 Ridgeview Center Dr. 47677 Galleon Dr. 2875 NE 191st Street Suite 305

Duncan, SC 29681

Plymouth, M1 48170

Miami, FL 33180

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

1. Proposal Price(s) (continued)

3a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "'7#5 Alumoweld"
bare conductor wire (Item 3a, Page CD-3)

3b. Freight charge for delivery of the " 7#5
Alumoweld"" bare conductor wire above
F.O.B., Auburn, NE 68305

4a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "'7#8 Alumoweld"
bare conductor wire (Item 4a, Page CD-3):

4b. Freight charge for delivery of the "'7#8
Alumoweld" bare conductor wire above,
F.O.B. Auburn, NE 68305

2. Completion Guarantee
Desired Delivery Dates
Items la, 23, 3a & 4a

Start Delivery - October 1, 2015
End Delivery - November 31, 2015

$9,360.00

Included

$5,847.40

Included

Guaranteed Delivery Dates

October 1, 2015
November 31, 2015

Guaranteed Delivery Dates

10/1/2015
11/31/2015

$9,450.00

$5,289.70

$169.35

Guaranteed Delivery Dates

Delivery dates are guaranteed as
required. Actual delivery lead time is

6-8 weeks ARO.




TABULATION OF BIDS
Opened at 2:00 p.m., C.D.T., Tuesday
August 5, 2014, in Omaha, Nebraska

Anticipated Award Date
September 11, 2014

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 4359

OPPD 345KV MTP-NT & 69KV LINE 58/71
BARE ASCR CONDUCTOR WIRE

Division Manager
Material Management

Compiled by and Certified Correct

$5,600,000.00
Page 3 of 6
BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS
General Cable Gexpro SANPEC, Inc.
4 Tesseweer Dr. 1920 Paul St. 11819 Skydale Drive
BID ITEM

Highland Hts, KY 41076

Omaha, NE 68102

Tomball, TX 77375 U.S.A.

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

1. Proposal Price(s)

la. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "ASCR Twisted
Pair Grosbeak™ bare conductor wire (Item
la, Page CD-2)

1b. Freight charge for delivery of the
'ASCR Twisted Pair Grosbeak' bare
conductor wire above F.O.B. Auburn, NE
68305

2a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the ""ASCR Parakeet"
bare conductor wire (Item 2a, Page CD-2)

2b. Freight charge for delivery of the
'ASCR Parakeet' bare conductor wire
above F.O.B. Auburn, NE 68305

$1,283,956.80

$62,295.00

$438,357.60

$20,800.00

$1199 M/FT

FOB Factory/Shipping Point
FRT Allowed

Not Quoted

Not Quoted

$364,062.00

$69,112.00




TABULATION OF BIDS
Opened at 2:00 p.m., C.D.T., Tuesday
August 5, 2014, in Omaha, Nebraska

Anticipated Award Date
September 11, 2014

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 4359

OPPD 345KV MTP-NT & 69KV LINE 58/71
BARE ASCR CONDUCTOR WIRE

Division Manager
Material Management

Compiled by and Certified Correct

$5,600,000.00
Page 4 of 6
BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS
General Cable Gexpro SANPEC, Inc.
4 Tesseweer Dr. 1920 Paul St. 11819 Skydale Drive
BID ITEM

Highland Hts, KY 41076

Omaha, NE 68102

Tomball, TX 77375 U.S.A.

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

1. Proposal Price(s) (continued)

3a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "'7#5 Alumoweld"
bare conductor wire (Item 3a, Page CD-3)

3b. Freight charge for delivery of the " 7#5
Alumoweld"" bare conductor wire above
F.O.B., Auburn, NE 68305

4a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "'7#8 Alumoweld"
bare conductor wire (Item 4a, Page CD-3):

4b. Freight charge for delivery of the "'7#8
Alumoweld" bare conductor wire above,
F.O.B. Auburn, NE 68305

. Completion Guarantee
Desired Delivery Dates
Items la, 23, 3a & 4a

Start Delivery - October 1, 2015
End Delivery - November 31, 2015

$11,295.00

$600.00

$6,354.40

$320.00

Guaranteed Delivery Dates

October 01, 2015
November 31, 2015

$739 M/ET

FOB Shipping Point
FRT Allowed

$369 M/ET

FOB Shipping Point
FRT Allowed

Guaranteed Delivery Dates

10/1/15
11/31/15

Not Quoted

Not Quoted

Not Quoted

Not Quoted

Guaranteed Delivery Dates

Noted and Complied
Noted and Complied




TABULATION OF BIDS
Opened at 2:00 p.m., C.D.T., Tuesday
August 5, 2014, in Omaha, Nebraska

Anticipated Award Date
September 11, 2014

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 4359

OPPD 345KV MTP-NT & 69KV LINE 58/71
BARE ASCR CONDUCTOR WIRE

Division Manager
Material Management

Compiled by and Certified Correct

$5,600,000.00
Page 5 of 6
BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS
Southwire
1 Southwire Dr.
BID ITEM

Carrollton, GA 30119

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

SUPPLIER'S BID

1. Proposal Price(s)

la. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "ASCR Twisted
Pair Grosbeak™ bare conductor wire (Item
la, Page CD-2)

1b. Freight charge for delivery of the
'ASCR Twisted Pair Grosbeak' bare
conductor wire above F.O.B. Auburn, NE
68305

2a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the ""ASCR Parakeet"
bare conductor wire (Item 2a, Page CD-2)

2b. Freight charge for delivery of the
'ASCR Parakeet' bare conductor wire
above F.O.B. Auburn, NE 68305

$2800.00/MET

$100.00/MFT

$1040.00/MET

$216.00/MET




TABULATION OF BIDS
Opened at 2:00 p.m., C.D.T., Tuesday

August 5, 2014, in Omaha, Nebraska

Division Manager
Anticipated Award Date REQUEST FOR PROPOSAL NO. 4359 Material Management
September 11, 2014

OPPD 345KV MTP-NT & 69KV LINE 58/71 : —
Compiled by and Certified Correct

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE BARE ASCR CONDUCTOR WIRE
$5,600,000.00
Page 6 of 6
BIDDER'S NAME & ADDRESS
Southwire
BID ITEM 1 Southwire Dr.
Carrollton, GA 30119
SUPPLIER'S BID SUPPLIER'S BID SUPPLIER'S BID
1. Proposal Price(s) (continued)
3a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "'7#5 Alumoweld"
bare conductor wire (Item 3a, Page CD-3) No Quote
3b. Freight charge for delivery of the " 7#5
Alumoweld" bare conductor wire above
F.O.B., Auburn, NE 68305 No Quote

4a. Firm base price to furnish F.O.B.
shipping point, all of the "'7#8 Alumoweld"
bare conductor wire (Item 4a, Page CD-3): No Quote

4b. Freight charge for delivery of the "'7#8
Alumoweld" bare conductor wire above,

F.O.B. Auburn, NE 68305 No Quote
2. Completion Guarantee Guaranteed Delivery Dates

Desired Delivery Dates
Items la, 23, 3a & 4a

Start Delivery - October 1, 2015 Oct. 1, 2015
End Delivery - November 31, 2015 Nov. 31, 2015




